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Laidback Coastal - Living

Floor Lamp
Floor Lamp will create a casual
yet sophisticated style for your
living space. It starts with a
natural timber base, continues
with an arced powder-coated
light grey stand, and
culminates with a hand-woven
rattan shade. As the shade
hangs to the side of the lamp
body, light can be positioned
towards the edge of a couch or
armchair. Whether you are
going for a coastal,
contemporary or Scandinavian
theme - the Weave Floor Lamp
will fit in perfectly.

-

-
Product Code

-
Lead time

1
Qty

Natural, Light Grey
Colour

-
Material

-
Finish

400
Width (mm)

1850
Height (mm)

-
Length (mm)

1080
Depth (mm)

Vase
-

-

-
Product Code

-
Lead time

2
Qty

-
Colour

Ceramic
Material

-
Finish

18
Width (mm)

23
Height (mm)

5
Length (mm)

-
Depth (mm)

Vase
-

-

-
Product Code

-
Lead time

2
Qty

-
Colour

Ceramic
Material

-
Finish

-
Width (mm)

13
Height (mm)

29
Length (mm)

-
Depth (mm)

Entertainment Unit
-

-

-
Product Code

-
Lead time

1
Qty

-
Colour

Teak
Material

-
Finish

1800
Width (mm)

500
Height (mm)

-
Length (mm)

460
Depth (mm)

Internal dimensions: W540 x D425 x H280mm

Coffee Table
Merging curved surface and
linear patterns, the Tully Coffee
Table combines an open
modern design with a hint of
mid-century nostalgia to
showcase your unique
personality through every
detail. Boasting a solid teak
construction, the subtle linear
detailing in the base of the
pillar adds subtle tactile
interest while keeping your
décor light and airy.

-

CTO-TULLY-NTK
Product Code

In Stock
Lead time

1
Qty

-
Colour

Natural Teak
Material

-
Finish

900
Width (mm)

350
Height (mm)

-
Length (mm)

900
Depth (mm)

Width: Base = 450mm Dia
Height To Underside Of Top: 325mm

Side Table
The Element Earth side table
will easily lift the design
aesthetic in any space with its
sculptural form and textured
finish. Simple but striking, this
cement side table will add a
raw and grounding element to
any space.

-

LTO-ELEM-EAR-X
Product Code

-
Lead time

1
Qty

Fossil
Colour

Pumice
Material

-
Finish

330
Width (mm)

500
Height (mm)

-
Length (mm)

330
Depth (mm)
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Armchair
The Easi Armchair is a
reproduction of Hans J.
Wegners Easy Lounge Chair,
one of the most iconic Danish,
mid-century designs. Its
crafted by gifted artisans and is
made of a solid American Oak
frame and a handwoven paper
cord seat and backrest,
bringing an organic feel to any
space its placed in.

-

-
Product Code

In Stock
Lead time

2
Qty

Oak
Colour

-
Material

-
Finish

710
Width (mm)

730
Height (mm)

-
Length (mm)

760
Depth (mm)

Cushion
Handloomed from super soft
pure cotton, the Elio cushion is
a wonderfully versatile addition
to any space. Available in
neutral shades of Amaretti,
Coconut or Latte, this timeless
striped design is ideal for
adding to your bed or sofa.

-

-
Product Code

-
Lead time

1
Qty

Amaretti
Colour

Pure Cotton
Material

-
Finish

600
Width (mm)

-
Height (mm)

-
Length (mm)

600
Depth (mm)

Cushion
Handloomed from pure linen
with a subtle crinkled texture,
the Ava collection is a luxurious
addition to the home. Crafted
with a delicate fringing in a
range of timeless colours, this
relaxed woven cushion can be
styled effortlessly on the bed
or sofa.

-

-
Product Code

-
Lead time

1
Qty

-
Colour

Pure Linen
Material

-
Finish

500
Width (mm)

-
Height (mm)

-
Length (mm)

500
Depth (mm)

Cushion
Add textural depth and
character to any space with the
Salma collection. Featuring a
subtle herringbone weave
detail and contrast coloured
stripes, each piece is hand
woven in India from 100% linen
for a relaxed yet refined
aesthetic.

-

-
Product Code

-
Lead time

1
Qty

-
Colour

Linen
Material

-
Finish

500
Width (mm)

-
Height (mm)

-
Length (mm)

300
Depth (mm)

Cushion
Hand woven by skilled artisans,
Burton has a tactile, raw
aesthetic while remaining
refined and stylish. Crafted
from the finest European linen
with a relaxed Oxford edge.

-

-
Product Code

-
Lead time

1
Qty

-
Colour

Linen
Material

-
Finish

500
Width (mm)

500
Height (mm)

-
Length (mm)

-
Depth (mm)

3 of 4ML Home Curated Furniture Packages  /  Living Packages  /  18 November 2023  



Artwork
-

-

-
Product Code

-
Lead time

1
Qty

-
Colour

-
Material

-
Finish

1220
Width (mm)

870
Height (mm)

-
Length (mm)

-
Depth (mm)

Artwork
-

-

-
Product Code

In Stock
Lead time

1
Qty

-
Colour

-
Material

-
Finish

620
Width (mm)

870
Height (mm)

-
Length (mm)

-
Depth (mm)

Sofa
designed for comfort and
contemporary style. Raised on
slender wooden legs it's an
elegant choice for a living room
or family area for seating 4
comfortably.

-

-
Product Code

In Stock
Lead time

1
Qty

Oatmeal - Light Oak
Colour

Composition: 52%
Polyester,25%
Acrylic,10% Viscose,7%
Linen,6% Cotton
Martindale Count:
100,000
Material

-
Finish

2400
Width (mm)

760
Height (mm)

-
Length (mm)

930
Depth (mm)

Dimensions: Height to Back Cushion - 780mm
Seat Height: 420mm
Arm Height: 630mm
Seat Depth: 550mm
Leg Height: 160mm

Floor Rug
A Morroccan-inspired textural
flatweave, the Zigo rug
collection is handcrafted in a
high low pile from 100% pure
wool.

-

-
Product Code

-
Lead time

1
Qty

-
Colour

100% pure wool.
Material

-
Finish

2000
Width (mm)

-
Height (mm)

2900
Length (mm)

-
Depth (mm)
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